
Dingus, Zarecor & Associates PLLC is hiring an Experienced Senior Accountant. Individuals in 
this position are expected to: understand professional standards and regulatory and legal 
requirements of auditing and accounting; have passed the CPA exam; have experience in financial 
statement engagements in the healthcare and not-for-profit industries: specifically knowing 
pronouncements of the FASB, AICPA, and when assigned to governmental engagements, the 
GAO and GASB, be proficient at preparing financial statements, obtain exposure on the types of 
financial statement engagements offered by the firm, assume responsibility for unaudited financial 
statement engagements under the supervision of manager or partner while overseeing staff 
accountants on audit sections; if assigned to tax or cost report engagements: become equipped with 
pertinent CMS and IRC sections and regulations, obtain a working knowledge of research 
techniques and the various research sources in the firm library, become proficient in the 
preparation of cost reports and/or IRS Form 990 tax returns prepared by the firm, and assume 
responsibility for the completion of tax returns and/or cost reports under the supervision of 
manager or partner; travel occasionally for conferences or client visits. Place of employment: 
12015 E. Main Ave., Spokane Valley, WA 99206. Employees may need to travel in most of the 
states in the Midwest and the West, from Washington to Texas for conferences and client visits. 
Requires: Bachelor’s Degree in Accounting or related degree; CPA license; and 4 years current 
CPA experience. Salary $94,432.00. Benefits include 100% employee paid dental, healthcare, life, 
long-term disability, and vision insurance; 401(k) and 401(k) match; flexible schedules; remote 
work; training and continuous education; paid time off 160 hours for full-time employees, 7 paid 
holidays, expense reimbursement, plus up to $25 per month for a fitness membership. Send 
resumes to Lisa Hunter, lhunter@dzacpa.com, or 12015 E. Main Ave., Spokane Valley, WA 
99206. Drop-in applications will not be accepted. 
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